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Diversey Carefree Floor 

Finish Sealer #5104731
1040 As Spec $118.71 $123,458.40 As Spec $90.26 $93,870.40 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid As Spec $127.37 $132,464.80 As Spec $111.23 $115,679.20 As Spec $121.75 $126,620.00 As Spec $124.67 $129,656.80 

Diversey Crew # 

101102190
462 N/A N/A N/A As Spec $169.05 $78,101.10 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid As Spec $197.31 $91,157.22 As Spec $171.56 $79,260.72 As Spec $178.16 $82,309.92 As Spec $175.20 $80,942.40 

Diversey Bravo Heavy 

Duty Stripper # 

95115958

400 As Spec $55.62 $22,248.00 As Spec $50.74 $20,296.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid As Spec $60.52 $24,208.00 As Spec $52.60 $21,040.00 As Spec $72.44 $28,976.00 As Spec $68.15 $27,260.00 

Diversey Stride 

#904716
264 As Spec $177.14 $46,764.96 As Spec $142.99 $37,749.36 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid As Spec $187.96 $49,621.44 As Spec $163.43 $43,145.52 As Spec $177.67 $46,904.88 As Spec $184.30 $48,655.20 

Diversey Glance # 

100975197
198 No Bid $0.00 No Bid As Spec $63.23 $12,519.54 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid As Spec $93.90 $18,592.20 As Spec $81.63 $16,162.74 As Spec $116.00 $22,968.00 As Spec $73.26 $14,505.48 

Diversey Prominence # 

94996466
99 No Bid $0.00 No Bid As Spec $113.05 $11,191.95 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid As Spec $140.66 $13,925.34 As Spec $122.31 $12,108.69 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 As Spec $139.17 $13,777.83 

Diversey Forward # 

904965
33 As Spec $70.44 $2,324.52 As Spec $63.41 $2,092.53 No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid No Bid $0.00 No Bid As Spec $86.08 $2,840.64 As Spec $74.85 $2,470.05 As Spec $84.23 $2,779.59 As Spec $95.00 $3,135.00 

SC Johnson Hand 

Soap # AZU1L
2400 As Spec $69.67 $167,208.00 As Spec $60.97 $146,328.00 As Spec $34.83 $83,592.00 As Spec $34.79 $83,496.00 As Spec $35.46 $85,104.00 As Spec $40.09 $96,216.00 As Spec $49.38 $118,512.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid As Spec $34.89 $83,736.00 

SC Johnson Hand 

Sanitizer # 55857
120 As Spec $94.50 $11,340.00 As Spec $48.11 $5,773.20 As Spec $34.25 $4,110.00 As Spec $35.13 $4,215.60 As Spec $35.74 $4,288.80 As Spec $39.80 $47,760.00 As Spec $47.98 $5,757.60 No Bid $0.00 No Bid As Spec $39.64 $4,756.80 

Award Notes Awaded by line item to lowest bidder meeting terms and conditions. Three total awards were made to Pollock for all the Diveresy product, Kamo was awarded hand soap and Athens Janotor was awared hand sanitizer. 
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